

COST COMPARISON FOR RFP #6647-WATER TESTING SERVICES			Paragon Lab	Water Tech	NSF Lab	Underwriters Lab	Brighton Analytical
<u>Bacterial Parameters</u>	<u>Medium</u>	<u>Required Turn-around</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	
Coliform, Total*	Groundwater	24 hours	\$13.00	\$10.00	\$49.00	No Bid	No Bids
Coliform, Fecal	Groundwater	24 hours	\$9.00	\$10.00	\$61.00	No Bid	
Total Coliform and Plate Count**	Swimming pool	24 hours	\$21.75	\$12.00	\$66.00	No Bid	
E. Coli	Surface water	24 hours	\$13.00	\$12.00	\$53.00	No Bid	
Coliform, Fecal	Wastewater	24 hours	\$9.00	\$10.00	\$61.00	No Bid	
*Presence/absence test with E. coli confirmation on positive samples							
**Presence/absence coliform and standard plate county from one sample bottle							
NOTE: Bidder B-turn-around is 24-48 hours for Total Coliform and Plate Count							
<u>Chemical Parameters</u>	<u>Medium</u>	<u>Required Turn-around</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	
Nitrates	Groundwater	5 days	\$9.00	\$9.00	\$27.00	\$20.00	
Nitrites	Groundwater	5 days	\$9.00	\$9.00	\$27.00	\$20.00	
Arsenic	Groundwater	5 days	\$9.00	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$10.00	
Hardness, total	Groundwater	5 days	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$34.00	\$20.00	
Fluoride	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$10.00	\$48.00	\$15.00	
Sodium	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$10.00	\$21.00	\$10.00	
Manganese	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$10.00	\$16.00	\$10.00	
Chloride	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$8.00	\$28.00	\$20.00	
Tannin	Groundwater	5 days	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$54.00	No Bid	
Conductivity	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$5.00	\$19.00	\$10.00	
Barium	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$15.00	\$16.00	\$10.00	
Iron	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$10.00	\$22.00	\$10.00	
Lead	Groundwater	5 days	\$6.00	\$15.00	\$16.00	\$10.00	
Sulfate	Surface water	5 days	\$6.00	\$10.00	\$26.00	\$20.00	
Surfactant*	Surface water	5 days	\$30.00	\$40.00	\$46.00	No Bid	
Total Phosphorus	Surface water	5 days	\$15.00	\$22.00	\$20.00	\$15.00	
Orthophosphate, Phosphorus	Surface water	5 days	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$47.00	\$15.00	
Total Organic Carbon	Surface water	5 days	\$22.00	\$50.00	\$85.00	\$20.00	
Biochemical Oxygen Demand	Surface water	5 days	\$15.00	\$25.00	\$80.00	No Bid	
Biochemical Oxygen Demand	Wastewater	5 days	\$15.00	\$25.00	\$80.00	No Bid	
Total Suspended Solids (TSS)	Wastewater	5 days	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	
Oil and Grease	Surface water	5 days	\$45.00	\$50.00	\$99.00	No Bid	
Dissolved Oxygen	Surface water	5 days	\$6.00	\$8.00	\$18.00	\$10.00	
Ammonia	Surface water	5 days	\$6.00	\$20.00	\$76.00	\$15.00	
*EPA Method Number for surfactants is: 425.1							