

August 30, 2011

FOOD SUPPLIES  
CHILDRENS SERVICES  
RFP #6636

Crystal A. Wake  
Senior Buyer

Est. Qty.	Food and Supplies	Packing	Unit	GFS	Total	Est. Qty.	Packing	Unit	Karrs	Total
				Unit Price	Aggregate				Unit Price	Aggregate
<b>Part A - Produce</b>										
10	Baking Potatoes - Markon 2 cases 40 lb each	10 lb	Bags	\$ 29.45	\$ 58.90	10	10 lb	Bags		No Bid
15	Broccoli - Markon	20 lb	Box	\$ 16.92	\$ 253.80	15	20 lb	Box		No Bid
5	Cabbage - Superior	50 lb	Box	\$ 13.92	\$ 69.60	5	50 lb	Box		No Bid
15	Carrots - Superior 7.81 cs 16 3lb each	25 lb	Bags	\$ 18.20	\$ 142.19	15	25 lb	Bags		No Bid
10	Corn on the Cob - Lakeside	48 Ears	Bushel/Box	\$ 16.84	\$ 168.40	10	48 Ears	Bushel/Box		No Bid
5	Cucumber - Superior 2 cs 50lb	20 lb	Carton	\$ 14.23	\$ 28.46	5	20 lb	Carton		No Bid
50	Lettuce, Shredded Iceberg	5 lb	4/case	\$ 15.48	\$ 774.00	50	5 lb	4/case		No Bid
100	Lettuce Mix, Chopped Iceberg	5 lb	4/case	\$ 15.80	\$ 1,580.00	100	5 lb	4/case		No Bid
25	Tomatoes - Gentile 12.5 cs 20 lb	10 lb	carton	\$ 15.05	\$ 188.12	25	10 lb	carton		No Bid
5	Green Beans - Superior 4.81 cs 26 lb each	25 lb	Bushel/Box	\$ 28.19	\$ 135.53	5	25 lb	Bushel/Box		No Bid
15	Onions - Superior	10 lb	Bags	\$ 6.91	\$ 103.65	15	10 lb	Bags		No Bid
5	Peppers (Green/Red) Superior 12 ct	10-12 lb	Bushel/Box	\$ 16.07	\$ 160.70	5	10-12 lb	Bushel/Box		No Bid
5	Spinach - Superior	80 oz	10 oz/case	\$ 11.96	\$ 59.80	5	80 oz	10 oz/case		No Bid
5	Summer Squash - Superior	20-25 lb	Case	\$ 17.16	\$ 85.80	5	20-25 lb	Case		No Bid
5	Winter Squash - Superior	20-25 lb	Case	\$ 18.04	\$ 64.43	5	20-25 lb	Case		No Bid
10	Sweet Potatoes - Markon	40 lb	Bushel/Box	\$ 22.42	\$ 224.20	10	40 lb	Bushel/Box		No Bid
5	Zucchini - Superior	20 lb	Bushel/Box	\$ 25.28	\$ 505.60	5	20 lb	Bushel/Box		No Bid
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART A</b>					<b>\$ 4,603.18</b>					<b>No Bid</b>
<b>Part B - Fruit</b>										
60	Apples, Michigan Varieties - Markon	100-120 ct	case	\$ 39.68	\$ 2,705.46	60	100-120 ct	case		No Bid
40	Bananas	40 lb	case	\$ 21.29	\$ 851.60	40	40 lb	case		No Bid
5	Cantaloupe - Markon	40 lb	case	\$ 15.82	\$ 83.33	5	40 lb	case		No Bid
57	Oranges - Markon	138 ct	case	\$ 22.45	\$ 2,452.66	57	138 ct	case		No Bid
10	Dried Cherries - Cherry Cent	10 lb	case	\$ 58.63	\$ 586.30	10	10 lb	case	\$ 54.70	\$ 547.00
20	Grapes - Markon	2 lb	bags	\$ 25.36	\$ 56.36	20	2 lb	bags		No Bid
5	Muskmelon - Superior	40 lb	case	\$ 7.89	\$ 175.33	5	40 lb	case		No Bid
20	Peaches	138 ct	case		<b>NO BID</b>	20	138 ct	case		No Bid
30	Pears - Markon	20-30 lb	box	\$ 22.26	\$ 477.00	30	20-30 lb	box		No Bid
10	Plums - Markon	28 lb	bushel/box	\$ 23.88	\$ 303.93	10	28 lb	bushel/box		No Bid
2	Rhubarb - Superior 1.11 cs 18 lb	10 lb	carton	\$ 49.88	\$ 55.42	2	10 lb	carton		No Bid
2	Watermelon - Bruursema 4.76 cs 21 lb	50-60 lb	carton	\$ 7.78	\$ 37.05	2	50-60 lb	carton		No Bid

August 30, 2011

FOOD SUPPLIES  
CHILDRENS SERVICES  
RFP #6636

Crystal A. Wake  
Senior Buyer

<u>Est. Qty.</u>	<u>Food and Supplies</u>	<u>Packing</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>GFS</u> <u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u> <u>Aggregate</u>	<u>Est. Qty.</u>	<u>Packing</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Karrs</u> <u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u> <u>Aggregate</u>
	Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing									
	<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART B</b>				<b>\$ 7,784.44</b>					<b>\$ 547.00</b>
	<b>Part C - Dairy</b>									
5	Cheese - Parmesan, grated - Gusto/Sterling	5 lb	4/case	\$ 77.02	\$ 385.10		5 lb	4/case	\$ 73.50	\$ 367.50
10	Cheese - American slices - Amp	5 lb	4/case	\$ 53.45	\$ 534.50		5 lb	4/case	\$ 45.00	\$ 450.00
10	Cheese - American Swiss - Amp	5 lb	4/case	\$ 54.69	\$ 546.90		5 lb	4/case	No Bid	No Bid
40	Cream Cheese - Alouette	1 oz	100/case	\$ 21.12	\$ 844.80		1 oz	100/case	\$ 23.48	\$ 939.20
40	Eggs - Michaels	18 ct	8/case	\$ 19.19	\$ 1,256.07		18 ct	8/case		No Bid
40	Ice Cream - Country Fresh	5 gal	drum	\$ 19.75	\$ 1,316.67		5 gal	drum	\$ 14.50	\$ 580.00
15	Butter, sticks	1 lb	12/case		No Bid		1 lb	30/case		No Bid
1137	Milk, Homogenized, 2% - Country Fresh	8 oz	32/case	\$ 13.24	\$ 12,043.10		8 oz	48/case		No Bid
59	Milk, Homogenized, Chocolate - Country Fresh	8 oz	32/case	\$ 9.99	\$ 785.88		8 oz	48/case		No Bid
294	Yogurt, Light, All Varieties - Dannon	6 oz	12/case	\$ 7.02	\$ 2,063.88		6 oz	12/case		No Bid
20	String Cheese - Sterling	1 oz	168/case	\$ 48.95	\$ 1,027.95		1 oz	168/case		No Bid
	Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing									
	<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART C</b>				<b>\$ 20,804.85</b>					<b>\$ 2,336.70</b>
	<b>Part D - Beverages</b>									
80	Apple Juice, 100% Unsweetened	4 oz	72/case	\$ 12.87	\$ 1,059.02	80	5.5 oz	72/case	\$ 19.75	\$ 1,580.00
162	Orange Juice, 100% Unsweetened	4 oz	72/case	\$ 17.24	\$ 2,792.88	162	5.5 oz	48/case	\$ 19.15	\$ 3,102.30
	Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing									
	<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART D</b>				<b>\$ 3,851.90</b>					<b>\$ 4,682.30</b>
	<b>Part E - Bread</b>									
25	Bun - Hot Dog	6/pkg	12/case	\$ 25.22	\$ 315.25	25	6/pkg	12/case		No Bid
68	Bun - Hamburger, Plain	12/pkg	10/case	\$ 20.53	\$ 1,396.04	68	12/pkg	10/case		No Bid
30	Wheat Bread, sliced 1/2"	loaf	7/case	\$ 19.93	\$ 597.90	30	loaf	7/case		No Bid
	Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing									
	<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART E</b>				<b>\$ 2,309.19</b>					<b>No Bid</b>

August 30, 2011

FOOD SUPPLIES  
CHILDRENS SERVICES  
RFP #6636

Crystal A. Wake  
Senior Buyer

<u>Est. Qty.</u>	<u>Food and Supplies</u>	<u>Packing</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>GFS</u> <u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u> <u>Aggregate</u>	<u>Est. Qty.</u>	<u>Packing</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Karrs</u> <u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u> <u>Aggregate</u>
<b>Part F - Chicken and Turkey</b>										
44	Chicken Breast - patty, breaded	3.2 oz	100/case	\$ 16.68	\$ 733.92	22	3 oz	60/case		No Bid
69	Chicken Breast - Pre-cooked	3 oz	60/case	\$ 52.24	\$ 3,604.56	69	3 oz	56/case		No Bid
50	Chicken Fajita Strips	2.5 lb	4/case	\$ 39.10	\$ 1,955.00	50	2.5 lb	4/case	\$ 37.00	\$ 1,850.00
153	Chicken BBQ Wings	1.3 oz	15 lb/box	\$ 35.91	\$ 5,494.23	153	1.3 oz	10 lb/box		No Bid
4	Chicken, Diced White/Dark	10 lb	case	\$ 27.40	\$ 109.60	4	5 lb	2/case		No Bid
17.5	Chicken Nuggets, breaded	2/5 lb	case	\$ 23.16	\$ 405.30	35	10 lb	case	\$ 16.25	\$ 568.75
72	Chicken Tenders: Cheesey Jalepeno	2.5 lb	case	\$ 28.58	\$ 2,057.76	72	2.5 lb	case		No Bid
5	Turkey Breast, Ground	4/5 lb	case	\$ 29.90	\$ 149.50	5	4/5 lb	case		No Bid
2.67	Turkey Breast, Lunchmeat	lb	4/case	\$ 54.19	\$ 144.69	8	3 lb	4/case		No Bid
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART F</b>					<b>\$ 14,654.56</b>					<b>\$ 2,418.75</b>
<b>Part G - Beef and Pork</b>										
28.5	Beef - Patty, ground, frozen 80/20	2.5 oz	60/case	\$ 31.89	\$ 908.87	14.25	2.66 oz	120/case		No Bid
24	Beef - Ground bulk, 80/20, fresh	5 lb	24/case	\$ 48.65	\$ 1,167.60	16	5 lb	4/case		No Bid
40.5	Beef, Taco fill	5 lb	4/case	\$ 40.10	\$ 1,624.05	27	3 lb	6/case		No Bid
10.83	Pork - Chops, center cut, 14/12a	4 oz	12 lb/case	\$ 33.01	\$ 357.50	13	4 oz	10 lb/case		No Bid
3	Pork - Sausage, patties	1.5 oz	12 lb/case	\$ 27.61	\$ 82.83	5	1.5 oz	106/case	\$ 27.48	\$ 137.40
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART G</b>					<b>\$ 4,140.84</b>					<b>\$ 137.40</b>
<b>Part H - Meats, Misc.</b>										
11	Ham - Lunchmeat - Cargill	3 lb	6/case	\$ 38.18	\$ 419.98	11	3 lb	4/case		No Bid
32	Cod - Fillets, breaded - Icelandic	10 lb	case	\$ 27.77	\$ 888.64	32	10 lb	case	\$ 36.50	\$ 1,168.00
19	Polish Sausage - Kent Quality	10 lb	case	\$ 23.89	\$ 453.91	19	10 lb	case	\$ 23.13	\$ 439.47
14	All-Meat Franks, 8x1 - kent Quality	10 lb	case	\$ 17.60	\$ 246.40	14	10 lb	case	\$ 22.17	\$ 310.38
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART H</b>					<b>\$ 2,008.93</b>					<b>\$ 1,917.85</b>

August 30, 2011

FOOD SUPPLIES  
CHILDRENS SERVICES  
RFP #6636

Crystal A. Wake  
Senior Buyer

Est. Qty.	Food and Supplies	Packing	Unit	GFS		Est. Qty.	Packing	Unit	Karrs		
				Unit Price	Total Aggregate				Unit Price	Total Aggregate	
<b>Part I - Frozen Breads</b>											
66	Bagels, sliced, variety	6 ct	15/case	\$ 19.97	\$ 1,318.02	66	6 ct	90/case		No Bid	
76	Muffins, Variety	1.5 oz	3/24 pks	\$ 21.03	\$ 1,598.28	76	1.5 oz	3/24 pks		No Bid	
35	Dinner Roll	6-12 ct	case	\$ 23.10	\$ 808.50	35	1.5 oz	120/case		No Bid	
24	Breadsticks - Cheese Filled	3 oz	108/case	\$ 39.67	\$ 952.08	24	3 oz	108/case	\$ 42.59	\$ 1,022.16	
23	Frozen Pizza, Pepperoni	6 in	96 ct	\$ 62.47	\$ 1,436.81	23	6 in	96 ct	\$ 55.99	\$ 1,287.77	
7.5	Tortillas, flour 8"	12 ct	72/case	\$ 13.75	\$ 103.13	15	100 ct	100/case	\$ 18.29	\$ 274.35	
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing											
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART I</b>					<b>\$ 6,216.82</b>						<b>\$ 2,584.28</b>
<b>Part J - Frozen Vegetable, Staple, Misc.</b>											
24	Potatoes - French Fried	5 lb	6/case	\$ 31.12	\$ 746.88	24	6 lb	6/case	\$ 18.95	\$ 454.80	
11	Potatoes - Tator Tots	5 lb	6/case	\$ 30.56	\$ 336.16	11	5 lb	6/case	\$ 22.80	\$ 250.80	
9	Alfredo Sauce, Pouch	96 oz	4/case	\$ 63.40	\$ 570.60	9	96 oz	4/case	\$ 66.98	\$ 602.82	
12.5	Vegetable - Broccoli Florets	12/2.5 lb	case	\$ 27.61	\$ 345.13	10	12/2.5 lb	case	\$ 22.68	\$ 226.80	
4	Vegetable - Mixed Vegetables	1/30 lb	case	\$ 23.58	\$ 94.32	4	1/25 lb	case	\$ 26.99	\$ 107.96	
4	Vegetable - Peas	1/30 lb	case	\$ 23.79	\$ 95.16	11	1/25 lb	case	\$ 31.99	\$ 351.89	
8	Vegetable - Corn	6/4 lb	case	\$ 20.23	\$ 161.84	8	20 lb	case	\$ 16.48	\$ 131.84	
6	Vegetable - Green Beans	1/30 lb	case	\$ 31.11	\$ 186.66	6	1/30 lb	case	\$ 22.77	\$ 136.62	
11	Entrée - Chicken A La King	5 lb	4/case	\$ 44.29	\$ 487.19	11	5 lb	4/case		No Bid	
4.5	Entrée - Mac-n-Cheese	4.5 lb	4/case	\$ 30.45	\$ 137.03	5	4.5 lb	4/case	\$ 39.78	\$ 198.90	
20	Entrée - Salisbury Steak	4.5 lb	48/case	\$ 47.53	\$ 950.60	20	4.5 lb	case	\$ 53.99	\$ 1,079.80	
20	Entrée - lasagna	6 lb	6/case	\$ 63.63	\$ 1,272.60	20	6 lb	4/case	\$ 66.45	\$ 1,329.00	
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing											
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART J</b>					<b>\$ 5,384.16</b>						<b>\$ 4,871.23</b>

August 30, 2011

FOOD SUPPLIES  
CHILDRENS SERVICES  
RFP #6636

Crystal A. Wake  
Senior Buyer

<u>Est. Qty.</u>	<u>Food and Supplies</u>	<u>Packing</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>GFS</u> <u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u> <u>Aggregate</u>	<u>Est. Qty.</u>	<u>Packing</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Karrs</u> <u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u> <u>Aggregate</u>
<b>Part K - Canned Goods (pots., vegs, soup)</b>										
7	Potatoes Dehydrated - Pearl	3.5 lb	6/case	\$ 40.76	\$ 285.32	7	3.5 lb	6/case		No Bid
5.56	Potatoes Dehydrated - AuGratin	2.5 lb	6/case	\$ 40.88	\$ 227.29	5	2.5 lb	6/case		No Bid
8	Vegetable - Baked Beans	# 10	6/case	\$ 35.99	\$ 287.92	8	# 10	6/case		No Bid
5	Soup - Chicken Noodle	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 33.44	\$ 167.20	5	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 34.75	\$ 173.75
4	Soup - Cream of Broccoli	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 44.80	\$ 179.20	4	50 oz cans	12/case		No Bid
6	Soup - Cream of Celery	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 34.14	\$ 204.84	6	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 40.99	\$ 245.94
1	Soup - Vegetable Beef	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 49.34	\$ 49.34	1	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 56.50	\$ 56.50
6	Soup - Tomato	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 29.64	\$ 177.84	6	50 oz cans	12/case	\$ 31.75	\$ 190.50
5.5	Pasta, spaghetti	5 lb	4/case	\$ 22.16	\$ 121.88	11	10 lb	2/case		No Bid
24	Ravioli, Beef	10 lb	6/case	\$ 29.57	\$ 709.68	24	# 10	6/case		No Bid
6	Tuna, Light Chunk in Water	66.5 oz	6/case	\$ 44.16	\$ 264.96	6	66.5 oz	6/case	\$ 48.94	\$ 293.64
14	Stew, Beef	10 lb	6/case	\$ 68.25	\$ 955.50	14	# 10	6/case		No Bid
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART K</b>					<b>\$ 3,630.97</b>					<b>\$ 960.33</b>
<b>Part L - Packaged/Canned Goods - Snacks/Mixes</b>										
20	Snack - Trail Mix (snack size)	72-2 oz bag	case		No Bid	20	72-2 oz bag	case	\$ 29.94	\$ 598.80
100	Snack - Granola Bar, All Varities	12 each	10/case	\$ 21.45	\$ 2,145.00	80	12 each	10/case		No Bid
5	Real dried Fruit Snack	5 lb	case	\$ 58.63	\$ 293.15		5 lb	case		No Bid
15	Whole Wheat Crackers, (Individually wrapped)	300/case	case	\$ 19.34	\$ 290.10		300/case	case	\$ 20.13	\$ 301.95
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART L</b>					<b>\$ 2,728.25</b>					<b>\$ 900.75</b>
<b>Part M - Packaged/Canned Goods - sauce, misc.</b>										
10	Jelly cups, assorted	.5 oz	400/case	\$ 22.10	\$ 221.00	20	.5 oz	200/case	\$ 11.25	\$ 225.00
12	Instant Rice	24 oz	12/case	\$ 26.07	\$ 312.84	12	24 oz	12/case		No Bid
3	Pancake and Waffle Syrup	1 gallon	4/case	\$ 18.68	\$ 56.04	3	1 gallon	4/case	\$ 21.75	\$ 65.28
10	Sauce - BBQ	1 gallon	4/case	\$ 37.88	\$ 378.80	10	1 gallon	4/case	\$ 17.88	\$ 178.80
7	Sauce - Spaghetti,	106 oz	6/case	\$ 40.44	\$ 283.08	7	106 oz	6/case	\$ 43.57	\$ 304.99
10	Salsa, Chunky Style	.5 gallon	6/case	\$ 37.81	\$ 378.10	10	.5 gallon	6/case		No Bid
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART M</b>					<b>\$ 1,629.86</b>					<b>\$ 774.07</b>

August 30, 2011

FOOD SUPPLIES  
CHILDRENS SERVICES  
RFP #6636

Crystal A. Wake  
Senior Buyer

Est. Qty.	Food and Supplies	Packing	Unit	GFS		Est. Qty.	Packing	Unit	Karrs	
				Unit Price	Total Aggregate				Unit Price	Total Aggregate
<b>Part N: Packaged/Canned Goods - Misc.</b>										
134	Cereal, Bowl Pack, assorted	96 ea	case	\$ 37.60	\$ 5,038.40	134	96 ea	case	\$ 42.28	\$ 5,665.52
40	Cookies, chocolate chip/oatmeal	10 lb	case	\$ 19.26	\$ 770.40	86	10 lb	case		No Bid
98	Breakfast Bars, Nutri-Grain, assorted	16/1.3 oz	6/case	\$ 41.65	\$ 4,081.70	98	1.3 oz	48/case		No Bid
40	Rice Krispy Treats, original	20 ct	4/case	\$ 34.79	\$ 1,391.60	85	20 ct	4/case		No Bid
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART N</b>					<b>\$ 11,282.10</b>					<b>\$ 5,665.52</b>
<b>Part O - Packaged/Canned Goods - fruit, misc.</b>										
11	Fruit - Cocktail Light	# 10	6/case	\$ 32.90	\$ 361.90	11	# 10	6/case	\$ 28.93	\$ 318.23
20	Fruit - Peaches, Light, sliced	# 10	6/case	\$ 27.31	\$ 546.20	20	# 10	6/case	\$ 22.66	\$ 453.20
12	Fruit - Pears, Light, sliced	# 10	6/case	\$ 30.10	\$ 361.20	12	# 10	6/case	\$ 27.86	\$ 334.32
12	Fruit - Pineapple, Tidbits	# 10	6/case	\$ 30.14	\$ 361.68	12	# 10	6/case	\$ 31.33	\$ 375.96
15	Fruit - Mandarin Oranges	#10	6/case	\$ 34.93	\$ 523.95	15	# 10	6/case	\$ 29.56	\$ 443.40
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART O</b>					<b>\$ 2,154.93</b>					<b>\$ 1,925.11</b>
<b>Part P - Spices and Condiments - misc.</b>										
2	Non-dairy Creamer	24 oz	24/case	\$ 35.84	\$ 71.68	1	14 oz	24/case		No Bid
16	Honey - Individual packets	.5 oz	200/case	\$ 24.62	\$ 393.92	16	.5 oz	200/case	\$ 24.99	\$ 399.84
41	Ketchup, Individual packets	11 grams	500/case	\$ 14.60	\$ 598.60	41	9 grams	500/case	\$ 16.64	\$ 682.24
16	Mustard, Yellow, Individual packets	5.5 grams	1000/case	\$ 20.47	\$ 327.52	16	5.5 grams	1000/case	\$ 22.38	\$ 358.08
7	Relish, Sweet, Individual packets	.5 oz	case	\$ 9.54	\$ 66.78	7	9 grams	case		No Bid
9	Mayonnaise, Individual packets	12 grams	500/case	\$ 29.64	\$ 266.76	9	9 grams	500/case		No Bid
10	Salt, Iodized	26 oz	24/case	\$ 10.97	\$ 109.70	10	26 oz	24/case		No Bid
17	Salad Dressing, Ranch Buttermilk	1 gal	4/case	\$ 37.97	\$ 645.49	17	1 gal	4/case	\$ 41.60	\$ 707.20
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										
<b>TOTAL AGGREGATE PART P</b>					<b>\$ 2,480.45</b>					<b>\$ 2,147.36</b>
<b>Part Q - Paper Products and Cleaners, misc.</b>										
10	Gloves, Food Service, latex	100 ct	4/case	\$ 65.61	\$ 656.10	25	100 ct	10/case	\$ 12.00	\$ 300.00
20	Paper Plates, Heavyweight 8.5 in	125 ct	4/case	\$ 46.78	\$ 935.60	20	125 ct	4/case		No Bid
15	Plastic Cups, 12 oz. transparent	50 ct	20/case	\$ 32.16	\$ 482.40	15	50 ct	20/case	\$ 59.75	\$ 896.25
15	Dinner Napkins	375 ct	8/case	\$ 39.89	\$ 598.35	15	375 ct	8/case	\$ 22.50	\$ 337.50
Alternate Manufacturer/Brand & Packing										

