

BID SUMMARY
Parks Recreation for
Pierce Lake Golf Course

RFP # 6601
Fertilizer Pesticides

2/24/2011

Crystal A. Wake
Senior Buyer

	Agruim Advanced Technologies	Residex Turfgrass Inc.	Helena Chemical Company	Harrells LLC	John Deere Landscapes	Great Lakes Turf, LLC	Tri Turf
No. 1	No Bid	\$ 3,510.00	No Bid	\$ 1,950.00		No Bid	No Bid
Alt.					\$ 1,901.12		
No. 2	No Bid	\$ 405.00	No Bid	\$ 140.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alt.							
No. 3	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 684.00	\$ 1,012.32	No Bid	\$ 622.80
Alt.		\$ 522.24					
No. 4	No Bid	\$ 3,375.00	No Bid	\$ 3,060.00	No Bid	No Bid	
Alt.							\$ 2,925.00
No. 5	No Bid	\$ 3,135.00	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 2,575.00
Alt.					\$ 3,034.00		
No. 6	No Bid		\$ 575.00			No Bid	
Alt.		\$ 900.00		\$ 960.00	\$ 1,000.00		\$ 837.60
No. 7	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5,578.00	No Bid	\$ 4,990.00
Alt.		\$ 6,576.00					
No. 8	No Bid	\$ 3,635.40	No Bid	\$ 3,723.00		No Bid	\$ 1,649.05
Alt.					\$ 3,520.79		
No. 9	No Bid	\$ 7,875.00		\$ 6,075.00		No Bid	
Alt.		\$ 5,287.50	\$ 4,299.75		\$ 5,049.00		\$ 4,612.50

BID SUMMARY
Parks Recreation for
Pierce Lake Golf Course

RFP # 6601
Fertilizer Pesticides

2/24/2011

Crystal A. Wake
Senior Buyer

	Agruim Advanced Technologies	Residex Turfgrass Inc.	Helena Chemical Company	Harrells LLC	John Deere Landscapes	Great Lakes Turf, LLC	Tri Turf
No. 10 A	No Bid	\$ 1,312.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,312.50	No Bid	\$ 1,312.50
No. 10 B	No Bid	\$ 513.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 513.00
No. 11	\$ 5,775.00	\$ 5,857.50	\$ 5,857.50	\$ 5,857.50		No Bid	\$ 5,857.50
Alt.					\$ 5,857.80		
No. 12	\$ 2,325.00		\$ 2,325.00	\$ 1,650.00			
Alt.		\$ 1,695.00	\$ 1,584.00		\$ 1,680.00	\$ 1,852.50	\$ 1,650.00
No. 13	\$ 1,758.75	\$ 1,776.33	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 825.00		No Bid	
Alt.		\$ 945.00	\$ 720.00		\$ 858.72		\$ 711.00
No. 14 A	\$ 8,018.00	\$ 4,021.73	\$ 7,828.00	\$ 3,990.00	\$ 2,448.00	\$ 4,275.00	\$ 2,730.00
No. 14 B	\$ 2,060.00	\$ 2,690.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,060.00	No Bid	No Bid
No. 15	\$ 4,259.20	\$ 4,301.76	\$ 3,917.76	\$ 4,080.00		No Bid	
Alt.			\$ 3,132.80		\$ 4,480.00		\$ 2,656.00
No. 16	\$ 1,705.20	\$ 1,705.20	\$ 1,705.20	\$ 1,705.20	\$ 1,705.20	No Bid	\$ 1,705.20
No. 17	\$ 1,840.00	\$ 1,840.00	\$ 1,840.00	\$ 1,300.00			
Alt.			\$ 1,500.00		\$ 1,536.00	\$ 1,862.00	\$ 1,304.00
No. 18	\$ 1,420.80	\$ 1,459.20	\$ 1,459.20	\$ 1,441.12		No Bid	\$ 1,441.12
Alt.		\$ 1,441.12	\$ 1,441.12		\$ 5,383.24		

BID SUMMARY
Parks Recreation for
Pierce Lake Golf Course

RFP # 6601
Fertilizer Pesticides

2/24/2011

Crystal A. Wake
Senior Buyer

	Agruim	Residex	Helena	Harrells	John	Great	Tri
	Advanced	Turfgrass	Chemical	LLC	Deere	Lakes	Turf
	Technologies	Inc.	Company		Landscapes	Turf, LLC	
No. 19	\$ 970.05	\$ 1,015.00	\$ 1,024.10	\$ 1,085.00		No Bid	No Bid
Alt.					\$ 850.08		
No. 20	No Bid	\$ 4,480.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alt.			\$ 640.00				
No. 21	\$ 810.00	\$ 810.00	\$ 810.00	\$ 810.00	\$ 810.00	No Bid	No Bid
Alt.							
No. 22	No Bid			\$ 332.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 361.00	
Alt.		\$ 319.80	\$ 320.00				\$ 334.00
No. 23	\$ 1,497.00	\$ 1,497.00	\$ 1,497.00	\$ 1,497.00		No Bid	
Alt.			\$ 690.00		\$ 1,497.00		\$ 1,224.00
No. 24	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 1,555.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 1,555.00	\$ 1,550.00	No Bid	\$ 1,550.00
No. 25	\$ 1,764.95	\$ 2,032.00	\$ 3,876.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,193.92	No Bid	\$ 920.00
No. 26	\$ 469.13	\$ 484.00	\$ 448.96	\$ 520.00	\$ 572.00	No Bid	\$ 556.00
Alt.							
No. 27	\$ 898.50		\$ 898.44	\$ 312.00		\$ 399.00	
Alt.		\$ 324.00	\$ 160.00		\$ 370.80		\$ 135.00

BID SUMMARY
Parks Recreation for
Pierce Lake Golf Course

RFP # 6601
Fertilizer Pesticides

2/24/2011

Crystal A. Wake
Senior Buyer

	Agruim Advanced Technologies	Residex Turfgrass Inc.	Helena Chemical Company	Harrells LLC	John Deere Landscapes	Great Lakes Turf, LLC	Tri Turf
No. 28	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 156.54	No Bid	
Alt.		\$ 125.00					\$ 290.00
No. 29	No Bid	\$ 796.00		\$ 540.00		No Bid	
Alt.			\$ 300.00		\$ 484.96		\$ 560.00
No. 30	\$ 105.33			\$ 120.00		\$ 123.50	
Alt.		\$ 117.55	\$ 113.60		\$ 90.00		\$ 70.50
No. 31	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 300.00		\$ 266.00	\$ 252.00
Alt.		\$ 320.00			\$ 129.60		
No. 32		\$ 350.00		\$ 260.00		\$ 427.50	
Alt.	\$ 288.30		\$ 100.44		\$ 418.12		\$ 304.80
No. 33	\$ 595.00	\$ 846.25	\$ 850.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 665.00	No Bid	\$ 775.00
Alt.							
AMT. AWARDED	\$ 9,555.75	\$ 22,876.70	\$ 12,916.57	\$ 1,956.00	\$ 7,524.22	NO AWARD	\$ 5,900.70