



Priority One Emergency, Inc.

Priority One Emergency, Inc.	North Eastern Uniforms & Equipment, Inc.
---------------------------------------	--

North Eastern Uniforms & Equipment, Inc.

TROUSERS CLASS A			TROUSERS CLASS A
Womens			Womens
Traditional Style L2700TP-BS	NO BID	\$ 45.50	Traditional Style H.S. 2277
Optional Style L4800TPMS	NO BID	NA	Optional Style L4800TPMS
Mens			Mens
Traditional Style 2700TP	NO BID	\$ 57.75	Traditional Style Fecheimer 32223
Optional Style 4800TPMS	NO BID	\$ 80.00	Optional Style Fecheimer 32213/32260

TROUSERS CLASS B & C
Womens
5.11 TDU Pant Style 64359
<small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical PDU Class B Pants 64306</small>
Mens
5.11 TDU Pant Style 74280
<small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical PDU Class B Pants 74326</small>

TROUSERS CLASS B & C			TROUSERS CLASS B & C
Womens			Womens
5.11 TDU Pant Style 64359	\$ 49.99	\$ 35.99	5.11 TDU Pant Style 64359
Mens			Mens
5.11 TDU Pant Style 74280	\$ 49.99	\$ 39.99	5.11 TDU Pant Style 74280

SHORTS CLASS B & C
Womens
5.11 Tactical Style 63306
<small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro Shorts 63071</small>
Mens
5.11 Tactical Style 73285
<small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro Shorts 73287</small>

SHORTS CLASS B & C			SHORTS CLASS B & C
Womens			Womens
5.11 Tactical Style 63306	\$ 45.99	\$ 37.25	5.11 Tactical Style 63306
Mens			Mens
5.11 Tactical Style 73285	\$ 45.99	\$ 39.99	5.11 Tactical Style 73285
<small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro Shorts 73287</small>			<small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro Shorts 73287</small>

SHIRTS CLASS A
Womens
Long Sleeve Winter L3000DB
Short Sleeve Summer L3300DB
Dress Blouse (FECH) 3489160
Mens
Long Sleeve Winter 3000DB
Short Sleeve Summer 3300DB

SHIRTS CLASS A			SHIRTS CLASS A
Womens			Womens
Long Sleeve Winter L3000DB	NO BID	\$ 45.25	Long Sleeve Winter Fecheimer 102W6694
Short Sleeve Summer L3300DB	NO BID	\$ 40.25	Short Sleeve Summer Fecheimer 152r6694
Dress Blouse (FECH) 3489160	NO BID	\$ 184.95	Dress Blouse (FECH) 3489160
Mens			Mens
Long Sleeve Winter 3000DB	NO BID	\$ 46.95	Long Sleeve Winter Fecheimer 45w6694
Short Sleeve Summer 3300DB	NO BID	\$ 41.75	Short Sleeve Summer Fecheimer 95r6694

SHIRTS CLASS B & C			SHIRTS CLASS B & C		
Womens			Womens		
Long Sleeve 5.11 Taclite Pro Style 62070 <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical PDU Long Sleeve Shirt Class B Shirt 62065</small>	\$ 49.99	\$ 37.99	Long Sleeve 5.11 Taclite Pro Style 62070		
Short Sleeve 5.11 Taclite TDU Style 71339 <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical PDU Short Sleeve Shirt Class B Shirt 61159</small>	\$ 49.99	\$ 37.99	Short Sleeve 5.11 Taclite TDU Style 71339		

SHIRTS CLASS B & C			SHIRTS CLASS B & C		
Mens			Mens		
Long Sleeve 5.11 Taclite TDU Style 72054 <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical PDU Long Sleeve Shirt Class B Shirt 72344</small>	\$ 49.99	\$ 45.99	Long Sleeve 5.11 Taclite TDU Style 72175		
Short Sleeve 5.11 Taclite TDU Style 71339 <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical PDU Short Sleeve Shirt Class B Shirt 71177</small>	\$ 49.99	\$ 45.99	Short Sleeve 5.11 Taclite TDU Style 71175		

SEASONAL SHIRT CLASS B & C			SEASONAL SHIRT CLASS B & C		
Womens			Womens		
5.11 Performance Polo Style 61165 <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical Tactical Polo Style 61164</small>	\$ 39.99	\$ 32.99	5.11 Performance Polo Style 61165		
Mens			Mens		
5.11 Performance Polo Style 71049 <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical Tactical Polo Style 71182</small>	\$ 39.99	\$ 37.99	5.11 Performance Polo Style 71049		

DISPATCH CLASS A UNIFORMS			DISPATCH CLASS A UNIFORMS		
Tailored Pants 2700BN	NO BID	\$ 57.75	Tailored Pants Fecheimer 32223		
Womens			Womens		
Tailored Shirts L3300TN S/S, L3000TN L/S	NO BID	\$ 41.75	Tailored Shirts 152r6694 s/s 102w6694 l/s		
		\$ 46.95			
Mens			Mens		
Tailored Shirts 3300TN S/S, 3000TN L/S	NO BID	\$ 41.75	Tailored Shirts 95r6694 s/s, 45w6694 l/s		
		\$ 46.95			

SHOES			SHOES		
Mens			Mens		
Low Quarter Black w/Plain Toes <small>*Thorogood 834-6041</small>	\$ 70.00	\$ 83.50	Low Quarter Black w/Plain Toes		
Womens			Womens		
Low Quarter Black w/Plain Toes <small>*Thorogood 534-6041</small>	\$ 70.00	\$ 83.50	Low Quarter Black w/Plain Toes		

PATCHES			PATCHES		
Shoulder X74968A	\$ 3.50	\$ 2.50	Shoulder X74968A		
Chevrons	\$ 3.00/pair	\$ 1.25	Chevrons		
Specialty	\$ 3.50	?	Specialty		
Name Tapes	\$ 9.00	\$ 4.50	Name Tapes		
Star Patches	\$ 3.00	\$ 1.25	Star Patches		

Priority One Emergency, Inc.

North Eastern Uniforms & Equipment, Inc.

TIES			TIES		
Womens 14.5" 45005	\$ 3.50	\$ 4.00	Womens 14.5" 45005		
Mens Regular 8" 45015	\$ 3.50	\$ 4.00	Mens Regular 8" 45015		
Mens Long 20" 45045	\$ 3.50	\$ 4.00	Mens Long 20" 45045		

HATS Keystone MSPW-WASH			HATS Keystone MSPW-WASH		
Womens	\$ 69.99	\$ 65.00	Womens		
Mens	\$ 69.99	\$ 65.00	Mens		
Plastic Hat Covers BLAU107	NO BID	\$ 8.50	Plastic Hat Covers BLAU107		

HATS Class B & C			HATS Class B & C		
Womens	\$ 14.99	\$ 12.00	Womens		
Mens	\$ 14.99	\$ 12.00	Mens		

JACKETS			JACKETS		
5.11 Signature Jacket <small>*ALTERNATE: 5.11 Tactical 4 in 1 Jacket (includes separate neecee jacket for spring/fall) 48027</small>	\$ 199.99	\$ 175.99	5.11 Signature Jacket		

RAINCOATS Blauer 26990			RAINCOATS Blauer 26990		
Womens <small>*ALTERNATE: Liberty 586MFL</small>	\$ 79.99	\$ 99.00	Womens		
Mens <small>*ALTERNATE: Liberty 586MFL</small>	\$ 79.99	\$ 99.00	Mens		

LEATHER (Dutyman & ACCESSORIES)			LEATHER (Dutyman & ACCESSORIES)		
Holster 070-83, 383, 683-181 (R)/182(L) <small>*ALTERNATE: Safariland Brand</small>	\$ 174.99	\$ 132.00	Holster 070-83, 383, 683-181 (R)/182(L)		
Duty Belt (Outer) 5021U <small>*ALTERNATE Boston Leather 6521-3</small>	\$ 63.99	\$ 39.00	Duty Belt (Outer) 5021U		
Duty Belt (Inner) 5121U <small>*ALTERNATE: Boston Leather 6520-3</small>	\$ 35.99	\$ 18.00	Duty Belt (Inner) 5121U		
Handcuff Case 8121H <small>*ALTERNATE: Boston Leather 5514V-3</small>	\$ 27.99	\$ 20.50	Handcuff Case 8121H		
Handcuffs <small>*Smith & Wesson 350103</small>	\$ 24.99	\$ 28.00	Handcuffs		
Magazine Pouch 8521H (Med or Lg) <small>*ALTERNATE: Boston Leather 5601V-3</small>	\$ 27.99	\$ 30.25	Magazine Pouch 8521H (Med or Lg)		
ASR Holder (for 2 oz spray) <small>*ALTERNATE Boston Leather 5536-3</small>	\$ 19.99	\$ 18.85	ASR Holder (for 2 oz spray)		
Baton 52411 21"ASP	\$ 73.99	\$ 75.25	Baton 52411 21"ASP		
Baton Holder 52433	\$ 31.99	\$ 15.75	Baton Holder 52433		

Priority One Emergency, Inc.

North Eastern Uniforms & Equipment, Inc.

Radio Holder <small>*ALTERNATE: Boston Leather 5487-3</small>	\$ 26.99	\$ 16.95	Radio Holder
Key Strap 2021U <small>*ALTERNATE: Boston Leather 5448-3</small>	\$ 10.99	\$ 8.50	Key Strap 2021U

NYLON (Bianchi) & ACCESSORIES

Holster Safariland Model 6360 SLS Hood STX	\$ 159.99	\$ 116.25	Holster Safariland Model 6360 SLS Hood STX
Holster Safariland Model 6304 ALS	\$ 204.99	\$ 158.25	Holster Safariland Model 6304 ALS
Duty Belt, Liner, & 4 Keepers 7235	\$ 84.99	\$ 89.95	Duty Belt, Liner, & 4 Keepers 7235
Handcuff Case 7300	\$ 18.99	\$ 17.25	Handcuff Case 7300
Handcuffs	\$ 24.99	\$ 28.00	Handcuffs
Magazine Pouch	\$ 27.99	\$ 26.75	Magazine Pouch 7302
ASR Holder 7307	\$ 16.99	\$ 16.50	ASR Holder 7307
Baton 52411 21" ASP	\$ 73.99	\$ 75.25	Baton 52411 21" ASP
Baton Holder 7312	\$ 14.99	\$ 14.25	Baton Holder 7312
Radio Holder 7323	\$ 31.99	\$ 31.00	Radio Holder 7323
Silent Key Holder 7316	\$ 17.99	\$ 10.75	Silent Key Holder 7316

NYLON (Bianchi) & ACCESSORIES

BADGES (Blackinton)

Breast #B956	\$ 49.99	\$ 65.00	Breast #B956
Wallet #B956	\$ 49.99	\$ 65.00	Wallet #B956
Hat #B667-D	\$ 49.99	\$ 65.00	Hat #B667-D

BADGES (Blackinton)

NAME PLATES

Silver	\$ 10.00	\$ 8.00	Silver
Gold	\$ 10.00	\$ 8.00	Gold

NAME PLATES

TIE BARS

Womens BLACA367R	\$ 19.99	\$ 13.00	Womens BLACA367R
Mens BLACA367E	\$ 19.99	\$ 13.00	Mens BLACA367E

TIE BARS

VESTS

Traffic Safety Vest BLAUER 339S <small>*ALTERNATE: Radians LHV-207-SPT-SHF-R</small>	\$ 37.99	\$ 43.00	Traffic Safety Vest BLAUER 339S
Protective Vest -Male <small>Vendor & Model# GH Systems GHLITE Level 3A (Regular Sizing Only,O/S May incur additional charges</small>	\$ 675.00	\$ 648.00	Protective Vest -Male <small>Vendor & Model#_U.S. Armor Enforcer XP</small>
Protective Vest -Female <small>Vendor & Model# GH Systems GHLITE Level 3A (Regular Sizing Only,O/S May incur additional charges</small>	\$ 675.00	\$ 648.00	Protective Vest -Female <small>Vendor & Model#_U.S. Armor Enforcer XP</small>

VESTS

SET UP FEES

SET UP FEES	\$0.00	N/A	SET UP FEES
-------------	--------	-----	-------------

Created Sept 26, 2014

Tracy Murray/Management Assistant

