



RFP 6783 - SAN (Storage Area Network Solution)

Items listed will be part of the pricing evaluation

Storage Area Network Solution	Access Interactive	Advizex	AmeriNet	Aspire Global Solutions	Data Strategy/EMC	Dell Marketing	ISI	Merit Network	Netech
Base Bid	\$521,572.00	\$219,096.81	\$144,650.00	\$286,731.85	\$434,700.00	\$369,980.71	\$326,636.78	TBD based on service selected	\$719,312.93
Fiber Channel Switching	\$175,575.00	\$85,238.40	\$73,021.00	\$194,777.05	\$339,300.00	\$112,662.40	\$59,111.36		\$94,004.70
Backup Solution	\$460,487.00	\$204,984.14	No Bid	\$325,027.56	\$1,003,900.00	\$361,141.90	Included in tegile array	\$3,150 per	\$35,975.60
Archiving Solution	\$ -	\$303,766.50	No Bid	Included in above	Included in above	\$102,696.78	Included in tegile array	\$4,900 per	\$174,461.00
Maintenance	\$ -	\$197,471.83	\$23,007.00	\$78,458.32	Included in above	Included in above	Included		\$ -
Data Migration	Yes	Yes	No	Yes, add'l \$113,263.15	Yes	Yes, add'l \$103,333.00	Yes		No Bid
Optional Deliverables	\$303,600.00	\$ -	N/A	N/A	N/A	Active - \$122,943.60, Core - \$91,705.00	N/A		No Bid
Training/Support	\$ -	\$7,500.00	Free	\$5,100.00	N/A	Included in above	Included in installation		\$18,100.00
* As Read at Bid Opening *									